
IP PBX appliance is an advanced 
device designed to bring enter-
prise-grade voice, video, data, and 
mobility features. It is an advanced and 
stable device. IP PBX offers quick and 
easy setup and deployment using the 
web-browser user interface. 

The device allows businesses to unify 
multiple communication technologies, 
such comprehensive voice, video call-
ing, audio conferencing, and video 
surveillance, among others.

IP-PBX / SIP SERVER
 (NV-SIP)

Model -................

Overview

Features Benefits
The Device supports excellent video 
and audio communication.

It has got In-built card details record 
(CDR).
 
The device boats In-built Call recording 
feature

t is backed by Caller ID and follow me 
support. 
 
Compatible with 3rd party VoIP provid-
ers.

Multiple trunk and ring group are sup-
ported with this device.

Prevents accidents by alerting drivers 
to nearby obstacles. 

Helps navigate tight parking spaces 
with precision.

Reduces the time spent searching for 
available parking spots.

Detects pedestrians and objects in 
blind spots.
   
Minimizes parking-related damages 
and associated repair expenses.

Enhances convenience and red-
uces anxiety during parking ma-
neuvers.



Technical Specifications

RAM

HDD

CPU

SIP Users

Management Interface

Network Interface

System Architecture

Operating System
Database

8 GB

500 GB OR More as per requirements

Intel Xeon E3 Or Higher

Up to 5000 (Hardware configuration will differ for no of users)

Web Based Management (Chrome, Mozilla, Edge)

My SQL

1x 10/100/1000 Mbps

UBUNTU 14.04 or Higher
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 Brief product specifications are mentioned, that may change without prior notice, please check with OEM before purchase. Images are 
shown for reference only; the actual product may differ  due to product enhancement.

Disclaimer:

Web Based, Multi-tier system


